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3 COURSE MENU

PIZZA

Margherita
Tomato sauce & Mozzarella.
Pancetta
Italian bacon, spinach & cherry 
tomatoes.
Picante
Mozzarella & pepperoni.
Bueno sano
Chicken, pepper & onions.

CREATE A PIZZA

With your favourite toppings:

Sweet pepper | onion |  pepper 
cherry tomato | jalapeños 
mushrooms | spinach | pineapple

Blue cheese | sundried tomatoes 
pepperoni | ham | tuna | smoked 
salmon | bacon | chicken  

MAIN

Classic beef burger 180gr
Cheddar cheese, onion, tomato, 
bacon, cocktail sauce and potato 
wedges.

Picanha beef steak
Served with sweet potato fries, 
salad and chimichurri.

Cod marinated in 
pepper & garlic
Crunchy fennel salad, potato pie 
and white Port & saffron sauce.

Vegan masala
A vegetable curry with cauliflo-
wer, sweet potato and chickpeas 
served with basmati rice.

Weekly catch & meat specials
Find the specials on the 
chalkboards or ask our staff.

STARTERS

Soup from around the world
Feeling adventurous? Discover a 
different soup every week.

Gyoza & Dumplings
A steamed mix of pork, shrimp 
& veggies.

Vitello tonnato     
Sliced veal served with tuna 
mayonnaise and capers.

Burrata salad      
A mixed salad with sundried 
tomatoes, caramelized peach and 
burrata.

Caesar salad        
With egg, avocado, Parmesan, 
anchovies, bacon & chicken or 
vegan chicken. 

Chioggia beetroot salad        
With goat cheese, honey, pecan 
nuts, roasted sweet pepper, 
grapes and cherry tomatoes.
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Please notify our staff if you have any allergies.

We are a cash free property.

Vegetarian 		  Vegan

Optional vegetarian


